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The Monterey School Resource
Officer (SRO) gave a presentation at
the Monterey Institute of International
Studies to welcome new international
students to Monterey and share
crime prevention tips. 
The SRO assisted Monterey High
and Monte Vista schools with active
shooter drills. 
Two separate social media threats of
violence against a school were
investigated.   
The Peninsula Regional Violence
and Narcotics Team arrested
suspects in Seaside and in Monterey
for possession of narcotics for sales. 
The Community Action Team (CAT)
assisted the Monterey Domestic
Violence Advocate in locating a
homeless domestic violence victim
from Georgia.  The victim may be
eligible for housing and the process
for placement has been initiated. 

The CAT assisted at the Monterey
County Fair, the Monterey 250
unveiling, the Emergency
Preparedness Fair at Del Monte
Center, the Jazz Festival, the Santa
Rosalia Parade and Monterey
Park(ing) Day. 
Officers responded to a shots fired
call.  The SRO notified a nearby
school which went on lockdown while
other officers took up fixed points to
keep traffic and parents from the
danger zone.  After 45 minutes of
negotiation, officers were able to
convince the suspect to surrender
peacefully.  A search of the
residence led to the seizure of
multiple guns, evidence of the
shooting, and the suspect’s arrest.
 Several citizens and school staff
commended the School Resource
Officer and the Monterey Police
Department for their timely and
professional response.  

Narrative Cont... 



Alvarado Street - 107

Cannery Row - 93

City Hall - 2

Del Monte Beach - 71

Laguna Grande - 35

Monterey Library - 3

Recreation Trail - 38

Transit Plaza - 34

Wharf 1 - 78

Wharf 2 - 53

Other - 34

Police Officers 149 hours
Community Service Officers 96 hours
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Sworn (as of 09/30/18) 

    53 authorized  

       -2 unfilled  

       -0 extended leave  

       -2 academy  

       -3 training  

       -2 light duty  

 “Street ready” down 17% 

 

 Non-Sworn (as of 09/30/18) 

    19 authorized  

        -1 unfilled PSA  

        -1 unfilled PST  

        -1 CSO  

        -1 PST light duty 

 Down 21% 

MPD Proactive Foot Patrol (by
number of foot patrols) 

Tidelands Area 

TOTAL TIDELANDS AREA 245 hours 

TOTAL FOOT PATROLS 548 

Staffing 
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